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No one’s watching.

The phenomenon of providence is seemingly supernatural.


Have you ever seen something happen that you couldn’t explain?  
What you said impacted the world, as if it happened by way of 
magic or miracle.


You read the word “water” — immediately someone splashes you 
with their wet hands; perhaps you see the same name everywhere 
you go.  The particularity of the event goes beyond mere chance.


Synchronicities are meaningful coincidences where there is no 
clear causal relationship.


Technology is powerful.  It would be easy enough to explain 
synchronicities appearing in movies and TV, advertisements, and 
news as being the result of having lots of eyes on you.


What about when it’s like the universe read your mind, and it gave 
you exactly what you wanted?


Privacy is invisible, unless you know where to look; in order to 
create privacy, you have to be able to describe it.


We’re looking at privacy in a whole new light. 



Metaphysical Mysteries

Ocelot Privacy Foundation is researching leading-edge capabilities 
for instrumenting and influencing the universe, including those as 
of yet undiscovered, which may be able to preempt effects at any 
given point in time.


It’s important to be able to isolate when a synchronicity has 
occurred with certainty that there is no causal or practical 
influence.  


This is challenging, considering the capabilities of social media and 
the possibilities of secret or undiscovered technology.  I’m inclined 
to seek a practical, if even extraordinary, explanation.


It is possible that the universe operates on a principle of 
probability, and synchronicities happen by virtue of being likely to 
occur.


That through will and concentrated effort, we are influencing the 
collective consciousness of the world — truly, a shared and always 
changing psyche underlying existence.


By this line of reasoning, the universe may be the most likely 
manifestation of all prior circumstances at any point in time.


In contrast, if these occurrences would be explained by a 
sufficiently advanced technology, it’s possible that the world can 
be influenced in real-time, even non-linearly.


If random number generators can be preempted, or even things 
requiring human input, such a technology could cause a particular 
car to have a particular license plate.


Could you even anticipate that I would drive by that car on a 
particular day?




Augmented Core

It’s about leading edge technology, but it’s also about the 
phenomenon of synthesis.


People have varying theories about the universe being a simulation, 
or many parallel universes existing with different circumstances 
and events taking place; probabilistic reality that borders on 
synthetic.


Say there is a veil of synthesis, behind which some natural or 
intelligently designed substrate exists that allows our reality to 
exist.  How will we know where to find it?


Blue Cipher

If our thoughts may not be private, how shall we remain free to 
determine our own destiny?  


Has the universe always been subject to this providence, the very 
same orchestrating power from the time of Moses?


Free will ought to transcend the capabilities of any technology.   It is 
necessary to innovate at the leading edge, so we’re taking privacy 
seriously, even when it is difficult to circumscribe what capabilities 
may exist. 



Privacy is Trust

People are surprised when they find out how powerful data is.


In the digital age, companies are leveraging data and analytics in 
exciting new ways, leading to powerful insights and rapid 
innovation.  Data enables us to strategize and make verifiable 
decisions about the world.


With new capabilities in machine learning and parallelized 
computing, we have better visibility than ever into the world and 
the way we live our lives.


People expect privacy, which means having choices about how our 
data is used and understanding what privacy is all about.


Just between us.

When people use your products or services, do they get to choose 
how their information is used?


Next generation technologies give us the freedom to share and 
collaborate how we like.  Everyone wants to innovate like this, 
because it’s what sets apart the best in the industry.


It’s just right.

People have all new ideas about what technology is capable of.  It 
makes our lives easier, helps us learn and understand, keeps us 
healthy and fit, and gets us where we’re going!


Do you know what’s just right for you?  We love to stay connected, 
and we love freedom.  At Ocelot, we can have our cake and eat it, 
too.
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